
PYRA POOLE BAY REGATTA 
1ST, 2ND AND 3RD MAY 2021 

NOTICE OF RACE and RACE 
INSTRUCTIONS 

 
 

Entries will be accepted from any PYRA member. 

All entrants shall comply fully with; RYA Guidance on sailing & 
racing with participants from different households during COVID-
19 in England.  

There shall be no gathering ashore.  Results for races 1 and 2 will 
be announced on Zoom at 19.30 on the 2nd May. 

Entries may be split into three classes:  Classes 1 & 2 dependant 
on their VPRS rating plus a Non-Spinnaker class. 

Day 1 (1st May)  Will comprise; Practice Starts plus a practice 
‘Windward-Leeward’ race with ‘Off Boat’ Coaching by a team of 
Expert Sailors.   First Start 13.00 BST 

Day 2 (2nd May)  Will comprise two windward-leeward races in 
Poole Bay.  Race 1, first start will be at 11.00.  Race 2 will start 
soon after the completion of race 1.  

Committee Boat for Days 1&2 will be a Harrier an Elan 36 
displaying a PYRA flag. Communications will be as noted in the 
Red Book. Start sequences will be broadcast on the day. 

Day 3 (3rd May) will be the ‘Navigator’s Challenge’, for the fastest 
corrected time passing the following three marks in any order, 
within 2 boat lengths:   

Pass to the South West of Tony Brookes (ex Chalys). 



To the South East of Magnum (ex Perenco) 

To the North East of Bournemouth. 

Competitors shall self-start using the Swash line between 09.30 
and 11.00 and then self-finish on the Poole Finish Line.  Start and 
finish times must be lodged with the Results secretary by 14.00 
on the 3rd May. 

In the case of adverse weather racing may be postponed or 
cancelled at the discretion of the race committee. 

All racing will take place in Poole Bay and all entries shall comply 
with World Sailing and PYRA requirements for Inshore Racing.  

This Notice of Race and Race Instructions shall be read in 
conjunction with the Red Book. 

 

 
 
 


